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ACTION: Notice of off-road vehicle 
designation. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces the 
Bureau of Reclamation’s designation of 
areas for authorized off-road vehicle 
(ORV) use on Federal lands surrounding 
Twin Buttes Reservoir, which is part of 
the Bureau of Reclamation’s San Angelo 
Project in Tom Green County, Texas. 
DATES: This ORV designation is effective 
immediately and is permanent until 
canceled, amended, or replaced by the 
Bureau of Reclamation. 
ADDRESSES: A copy of the off-road 
designation, including the 
Environmental Assessment and Finding 
of No Significant Impact, is available at 
https://www.usbr.gov/gp/otao/. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Mr. 
Trent Parish, Bureau of Reclamation, 
Oklahoma-Texas Area Office, 5316 
Highway 290 West, Suite 110, Austin, 
TX 78735; (512) 899–4150; or email 
jparish@usbr.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The use of 
off-road vehicles on public lands 
associated with Twin Buttes Reservoir, 
TX must be designated in accordance 
with 43 CFR 420 and other applicable 
Federal rules and regulations. In 
recognition of this, and with the 
prerequisite to ensure compliance with 
such Federal regulations, Reclamation, 
Texas Parks Wildlife Department, and 
the City of San Angelo completed a 
comprehensive inventory and condition 
assessment of existing resources, and 
coordinated extensively with local 
stakeholders to seek input from the 
public on preferred ORV uses, as well 
on overall recreation priorities. Federal 
lands were evaluated according to 
criteria outlined in 43 CFR 420.22 to 
determine their suitability for ORV use. 
This included all Federal lands 
associated with the San Angelo Project 
and Twin Buttes Reservoir located 
within Tom Green County, Texas. The 
assessment resulted in the proposed 
designation of 73 miles of trails and 
three ORV areas. This designation is the 
culmination of resource considerations 
and public involvement integrated into 
an Environmental Assessment and 
Finding of No Significant Impact (19– 
18–TX–SA) that were completed in 
accordance with the National 
Environmental Protection Act of 1969. 

The ORV designation includes: 
(a) Approximately 56 miles of 

designated access routes. Access routes 
provide reasonable access to lands 
surrounding Twin Buttes Reservoir’s 
North and South Pools. 

(b) Approximately 17 miles of 
Motorcycle/All-Terrain Vehicle (Moto/ 
ATV) routes. Moto/ATV routes are a 

network of one-directional trails 
designated for motorized use by 
motorcycles and small ATVs 

(c) Approximately 338 acres of ORV 
areas. The ORV areas are comprised of 
three separate tracts of land with 
variable terrain requiring more diverse 
ORV skill levels. 

Mark A. Treviño, 
Oklahoma—Texas Area Manager, Bureau of 
Reclamation, Arkansas-Rio Grande-Texas- 
Gulf—Interior Region 6. 
[FR Doc. 2020–10349 Filed 5–13–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4332–90–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation No. 731–TA–1012 (Third 
Review)] 

Frozen Fish Fillets From Vietnam; 
Scheduling of a Full Five-Year Review 

AGENCY: United States International 
Trade Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Commission hereby gives 
notice of the scheduling of a full review 
pursuant to the Tariff Act of 1930 (‘‘the 
Act’’) to determine whether revocation 
of the antidumping duty order on frozen 
fish fillets from Vietnam would be likely 
to lead to continuation or recurrence of 
material injury within a reasonably 
foreseeable time. The Commission has 
determined to exercise its authority to 
extend the review period by up to 90 
days. 

DATES: May 11, 2020. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Stamen Borisson ((202) 205–3125), 
Office of Investigations, U.S. 
International Trade Commission, 500 E 
Street SW, Washington, DC 20436. 
Hearing-impaired persons can obtain 
information on this matter by contacting 
the Commission’s TDD terminal on 202– 
205–1810. Persons with mobility 
impairments who will need special 
assistance in gaining access to the 
Commission should contact the Office 
of the Secretary at 202–205–2000. 
General information concerning the 
Commission may also be obtained by 
accessing its internet server (https://
www.usitc.gov). The public record for 
this review may be viewed on the 
Commission’s electronic docket (EDIS) 
at https://edis.usitc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background.—On January 6, 2020, the 
Commission determined that responses 
to its notice of institution of the subject 
five-year review were such that a full 
review should proceed (85 FR 3417, 

January 21, 2020); accordingly, a full 
review is being scheduled pursuant to 
section 751(c)(5) of the Tariff Act of 
1930 (19 U.S.C. 1675(c)(5)). A record of 
the Commissioners’ votes, the 
Commission’s statement on adequacy, 
and any individual Commissioner’s 
statements are available from the Office 
of the Secretary and at the 
Commission’s website. 

Participation in the review and public 
service list.—Persons, including 
industrial users of the subject 
merchandise and, if the merchandise is 
sold at the retail level, representative 
consumer organizations, wishing to 
participate in this review as parties 
must file an entry of appearance with 
the Secretary to the Commission, as 
provided in section 201.11 of the 
Commission’s rules, by 45 days after 
publication of this notice. A party that 
filed a notice of appearance following 
publication of the Commission’s notice 
of institution of the review need not file 
an additional notice of appearance. The 
Secretary will maintain a public service 
list containing the names and addresses 
of all persons, or their representatives, 
who are parties to the review. 

For further information concerning 
the conduct of this review and rules of 
general application, consult the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, part 201, subparts A and B 
(19 CFR part 201), and part 207, 
subparts A, D, E, and F (19 CFR part 
207). 

Please note the Secretary’s Office will 
accept only electronic filings at this 
time. Filings must be made through the 
Commission’s Electronic Document 
Information System (EDIS, https://
edis.usitc.gov). No in-person paper- 
based filings or paper copies of any 
electronic filings will be accepted until 
further notice. 

Limited disclosure of business 
proprietary information (BPI) under an 
administrative protective order (APO) 
and BPI service list.—Pursuant to 
section 207.7(a) of the Commission’s 
rules, the Secretary will make BPI 
gathered in this review available to 
authorized applicants under the APO 
issued in the review, provided that the 
application is made by 45 days after 
publication of this notice. Authorized 
applicants must represent interested 
parties, as defined by 19 U.S.C. 1677(9), 
who are parties to the review. A party 
granted access to BPI following 
publication of the Commission’s notice 
of institution of the review need not 
reapply for such access. A separate 
service list will be maintained by the 
Secretary for those parties authorized to 
receive BPI under the APO. 
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Staff report.—The prehearing staff 
report in the review will be placed in 
the nonpublic record on August 24, 
2020, and a public version will be 
issued thereafter, pursuant to section 
207.64 of the Commission’s rules. 

Hearing.—The Commission will hold 
a hearing in connection with the review 
beginning at 9:30 a.m. on Tuesday, 
September 15, 2020, at the U.S. 
International Trade Commission 
Building. Requests to appear at the 
hearing should be filed in writing with 
the Secretary to the Commission on or 
before September 4, 2020. A nonparty 
who has testimony that may aid the 
Commission’s deliberations may request 
permission to present a short statement 
at the hearing. All parties and 
nonparties desiring to appear at the 
hearing and make oral presentations 
should participate in a prehearing 
conference to be held on September 9, 
2020, at the U.S. International Trade 
Commission Building, if deemed 
necessary. Oral testimony and written 
materials to be submitted at the public 
hearing are governed by sections 
201.6(b)(2), 201.13(f), 207.24, and 
207.66 of the Commission’s rules. 
Parties must submit any request to 
present a portion of their hearing 
testimony in camera no later than 7 
business days prior to the date of the 
hearing. 

Written submissions.—Each party to 
the review may submit a prehearing 
brief to the Commission. Prehearing 
briefs must conform with the provisions 
of section 207.65 of the Commission’s 
rules; the deadline for filing is 
September 2, 2020. Parties may also file 
written testimony in connection with 
their presentation at the hearing, as 
provided in section 207.24 of the 
Commission’s rules, and posthearing 
briefs, which must conform with the 
provisions of section 207.67 of the 
Commission’s rules. The deadline for 
filing posthearing briefs is September 
22, 2020. In addition, any person who 
has not entered an appearance as a party 
to the review may submit a written 
statement of information pertinent to 
the subject of the review on or before 
September 22, 2020. On October 20, 
2020, the Commission will make 
available to parties all information on 
which they have not had an opportunity 
to comment. Parties may submit final 
comments on this information on or 
before October 22, 2020, but such final 
comments must not contain new factual 
information and must otherwise comply 
with section 207.68 of the Commission’s 
rules. All written submissions must 
conform with the provisions of section 
201.8 of the Commission’s rules; any 
submissions that contain BPI must also 

conform with the requirements of 
sections 201.6, 207.3, and 207.7 of the 
Commission’s rules. The Commission’s 
Handbook on Filing Procedures, 
available on the Commission’s website 
at https://www.usitc.gov/documents/ 
handbook_on_filing_procedures.pdf, 
elaborates upon the Commission’s 
procedures with respect to filings. 

Additional written submissions to the 
Commission, including requests 
pursuant to section 201.12 of the 
Commission’s rules, shall not be 
accepted unless good cause is shown for 
accepting such submissions, or unless 
the submission is pursuant to a specific 
request by a Commissioner or 
Commission staff. 

In accordance with sections 201.16(c) 
and 207.3 of the Commission’s rules, 
each document filed by a party to the 
review must be served on all other 
parties to the review (as identified by 
either the public or BPI service list), and 
a certificate of service must be timely 
filed. The Secretary will not accept a 
document for filing without a certificate 
of service. 

The Commission has determined that 
these reviews are extraordinarily 
complicated and therefore has 
determined to exercise its authority to 
extend the review period by up to 90 
days pursuant to 19 U.S.C.1675(c)(5)(B). 

Authority: This review is being 
conducted under authority of title VII of 
the Tariff Act of 1930; this notice is 
published pursuant to section 207.62 of 
the Commission’s rules. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: May 11, 2020. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2020–10358 Filed 5–13–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, Firearms 
and Explosives 

[OMB Number 1140–0076] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed eCollection 
eComments Requested; Revision of a 
Currently Approved Collection; 
Application for Restoration of 
Explosives Privileges—ATF Form 
5400.29 

AGENCY: Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, 
Firearms and Explosives, Department of 
Justice. 
ACTION: 60-day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Justice 
(DOJ), Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, 

Firearms and Explosives (ATF), will 
submit the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
The proposed information collection 
(IC) OMB 1140–0076 (Application for 
Restoration of Explosives Privileges— 
ATF Form 5400.29), is being revised to 
include multiple material and 
formatting changes. The proposed IC is 
also being published to obtain 
comments from the public and affected 
agencies. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until July 
13, 2020. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have additional comments, 
regarding the estimated public burden 
or associated response time, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions, or 
additional information, please contact: 
Laura O’Lena, NCETR/Explosives 
Enforcement and Training Division, 
Explosives Enforcement Branch, either 
by mail at 3750 Corporal Road, 
Huntsville, Alabama 35898, by email at 
EROD@atf.gov, or by telephone at 256– 
261–7640. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 
Overview of this information 

collection: 
1. Type of Information Collection 

(check justification or form 83): 
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